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Cat previous year papers with solutions pdf

CAT Previous Year Question Papers – From this page candidates can download CAT previous year question papers with answers. The previous year question papers are a great source of preparation for the upcoming exam. Common Admission Test (CAT) is a computer-based test. In the question paper of CAT
questions are included from 3 sections that are Verbal Ability and Reading Comprehension, Data Interpretation and Logical Reasoning and Quantitative Ability. Check CAT previous year question papers with answers from this page. CAT Previous Year Question Papers CAT is being held as a computer-based test form
2009, before that the exam was held as a pen and paper-based test. The paper pattern evolved in many ways from the mode of the exam to the number of questions and more. The CAT previous year question papers can help understand the evolution of the exam and also be prepared for the future CAT exams.
Download CAT previous year question papers with answers PDFs from the table below: CUCET 2021 Application Form CUCET - 2021 rewards your academic brilliance with global opportunities & extraordinary assistance with Scholarships worth Rs. 33 Crore. How To Use CAT Previous Year Question Papers Effectively
for Preparation To use the CAT Previous Year Question Papers, candidates must strategically use them for preparation. Below are some tips to do so: Set a goal: Set a goal of solving at least one previous year question paper a day. Make it a habit and also combine the solving of offline papers with mock tests, since
CAT is an online exam. Calculate and make a plan: Know how much time you can spend on each question asked in the exam. The total number of questions in the exam is 100 and the total time of the test is 3 hours or 180 minutes. This means candidates can afford to spend not more than 1.8 minutes per question.
Thus while practicing the CAT previous year question papers make sure each question is solved in less than 1.8 minutes. This will increase your speed for the test day. Maintain accuracy: While solving the past year question papers, make sure you take care of the accuracy too. Solve every question with utmost care and
try to make less mistakes. Check the answers using the answers of the question available. CAT Mock Test To practice for the computer-based test of CAT, here is a free mock test. Access using the direct links below: Looking at the past year papers of CAT, the evolution of the exam can be described as follows:
Changes in number of questions asked: From 2010 to 2013: The total number of question asked in CAT were 60.From 104 to till date: The number of questions has remained 100. Changes in number of section in the question paper: In 2010 the number of sections were 3 – QA, DI & LR and VAFrom 2011 to 2014, the
number of sections was reduced to 2 – QA & DI and LR & VAfrom 2015 to till date, the number of sections has been made again – QA, DI & LR and VA Change in marking scheme of the exam: The marking scheme has stayed the same which is +3 for correct answer and -1 for the wrong ones. No negative marking for
non-MCQ questions. CAT Current Question Paper Pattern The current paper pattern of CAT is given below: The exam pattern of CAT 2020 is given below: Duration: The entire test is held for a duration of 3 hours Mode: CAT 2020 is a computer based test (CBT) Language: It is held in English language only. Total
Number of Questions: There are a total of 100 questions in the exam. Marking Scheme: Each question is of 3 marks and for selecting an incorrect answer, negative marking of 1 mark is done. Type of questions: CAT has 2 type of questions – MCQs and TITA MCQs: Multiple choice type, in which candidates have to
choose 1 answer options multiple choices.TITA: Type in the answers type questions. Here, the candidates have to type the answer using the virtual keyboard. Sections: There are 3 sections in CAT, these sections are – VARC: Verbal Ability and Reading Comprehension.DILR: Data Interpretation and Logical
Reasoning.QA: Quantitative Ability. The distribution of the questions among the sections vary each year, last year the distribution of the question was as follows: Section NameTotal No. of Ques.No. of MCQsNo. of TITAVARC34277DILR32248QA342311TOTAL1007426 CAT – Common Admission Test Common
Admission Test is a national level entrance test that is conducted by one of the IIMs to offer admission into MBA / PGP courses. CAT is a computer-based test. It consists of multiple-choice questions (MCQs) and Type in the answer type questions (TITA). More than 200+ Business schools offer admission to students in
MBA course. It has questions from topics like Data Interpretation and Logical Reasoning (DILR), Verbal Ability, and Reading Comprehension (VARC), Quantitative Aptitude. Apart from the computer-based test, the candidates need to appear for Personal Interview (PI), Group Discussion (GD), Written Ability Test (WAT).
These 3 constituent parts of the admission process decide the final admission of the candidates. CAT To get fastest exam alerts and government job alerts in India, join our Telegram channel. Anwita Dhar | Updated On -Jun 21, 2021 In the article, we have provided the subject and slot-wise CAT Sample Paper of 2020,
2019, 2018 sessions. The negative marking in objective-type questions can be avoided by practicing the CAT sample papers provided below. Moreover, it is necessary to keep track of the time consumed while solving CAT sample papers as it will prepare the candidates to solve the actual paper within the stipulated time
period.  Prepare for CAT & Other MBA Exams, Get 10% Discount on Unacademy: DUNIA10   CAT 2019 Question Papers with Solutions Ques: What is the medium to get the free mock test for CAT? Ans: CAT aspiring candidates can download the subject and slot-wise sample papers from the links provided below in the
article. Moreover, the CAT conducting IIM will also release the official CAT Mock Test on their website a few weeks before the exam date.  Ques: What is the right way to appear for CAT Mock Test? Ans: When candidates will appear for the official CAT Mock Test only one section will appear on their screen. After
attempting that particular section they can move to the next section whereas they can download the previous years CAT question papers as per their choice of sections from the links that are provided in the article below.  Ques: When should I start taking CAT Mock Test? Ans: Solving CAT Mock Tests & question papers
requires time and one should only take the mock tests if he/she has completed CAT preparation. As per the test-takers, the right time to take CAT mock tests is 3 months before the exam date.  Ques: Can I use a calculator while solving CAT Question Paper? Ans: No. It is not advisable to use the calculator while solving
CAT question paper because no virtual or manual calculator is allowed inside the exam center.  Download CAT Previous Year Question Papers from the links below: *The article might have information for the previous academic years, which will be updated soon subject to the notification issued by the University/College.
Shekhar Suman Exams Prep Master | Updated On -Jun 21, 2021 Solving CAT Previous Year Question Papers will increase the familiarity of candidates with the pattern, type of questions, and difficulty level of the paper. CAT previous year question papers will also help you in analyzing the level of your performance.
Check CAT Exam Pattern Prepare for CAT & Other MBA Exams, Get 10% Discount on Unacademy: DUNIA10   Before appearing for CAT 2021, if candidates solve question papers, sample papers, and mock tests they can surely improve their performance by going through a variety of questions. CAT Question paper is
divided into the following three sections. CAT Quantitative Aptitude: A total of 32 questions are asked from this section and some of the major topics from this section are arithmetic, algebra, advanced mathematics, and geometry. CAT VARC: 34 questions are asked in this section from topics like vocabulary, grammar,
verbal reasoning, and reading comprehension. CAT DILR: From DILR also a total of 34 questions will be asked based on the topics like Arithmetic, geometrical data, puzzles on words, letters, arrangements, seating, etc. Quick Links: *The article might have information for the previous academic years, which will be
updated soon subject to the notification issued by the University/College. We at 2IIM Online CAT Coaching have taken enormous efforts to bring CAT 2020 Question Paper, CAT 2019 Question Paper, CAT 2018 Question paper and CAT 2017 Question Paper in a readable, easily accessible format for the benefit of
students aspiring to nail CAT Exam. CAT 2017 Question Paper, CAT 2018 Question Paper and CAT 2019 Question Paper with detailed Video solutions are available through this page. This Page is a repository of CAT Question Papers and CAT 2020 Question paper with correct answers is available. The student friendly
version with solutions will be made available soon. All CAT Previous Year Paper - Questions that are available will have detailed Video Solutions, accessible through this page. 2IIM has the Best CAT Online Coaching Courses in the Country. With enormous focus of Pedagogy, we strive to teach in best possible ways to
CAT Aspirants preparing for CAT Exam. To know more about what CAT Exam is all about and How to prepare for CAT, head on to the respective links. CAT 2020 Question Paper Quant Slot 1 CAT 2020 Question Paper Quant Slot 2 CAT 2020 Question Paper Quant Slot 3 CAT 2020 Question Paper DI LR Slot 1 CAT
2020 Question Paper DI LR Slot 2 CAT 2020 Question Paper DI LR Slot 3 CAT 2020 Question Paper VA RC Slot 1 CAT 2020 Question Paper VA RC Slot 2 CAT 2020 Question Paper VA RC Slot 3 CAT 2019 Question Paper Quant Slot 1 CAT 2019 Question Paper Quant Slot 2 CAT 2019 Question Paper DI LR Slot 1
CAT 2019 Question Paper DI LR Slot 2 CAT 2019 Question Paper VA RC Slot 1 CAT 2019 Question Paper VA RC Slot 2 CAT 2018 Question Paper Quant Slot 1 CAT 2018 Question Paper Quant Slot 2 CAT 2018 Question Paper DI LR Slot 1 CAT 2018 Question Paper DILR Slot 2 CAT 2018 Question Paper VA RC
Slot 1 CAT 2018 Question Paper VA RC Slot 2 CAT 2017 Question Paper Quant Slot 1 CAT 2017 Question Paper Quant Slot 2 CAT 2017 Question Paper DI LR Slot 1 CAT 2017 Question Paper DI LR Slot 2 CAT 2017 Question Paper VA RC Slot 1 CAT 2017 Question Paper VA RC Slot 2 Pay and Download It is
recommended to check out past CAT question papers in order to understand the types of questions asked, number of questions asked from a particular topic, toughness level etc. It will help you to figure out exam strategies as per different sections and the number of questions to attempt. Download CAT Study Material
Download CAT Formulas PDF CAT 2021 VA/RC Syllabus Sentence Correction Parajumble Fill in the Blanks – Vocabulary words Analogies Sentence Completion Critical Reasoning Fact, Inference & Judgement Idioms and Phrases Error Spotting CAT 2021 Data Interpretation Syllabus Bar Graphs Pie Charts Data
Charts, Data Tables Caselets Line Graph, Area Graph Miscellaneous Charts – Spider, Bubble etc. CAT 2021 Logical Reasoning Syllabus Blood Relations Seating Arrangement – Circular, Square etc. Direction Sense Coding-Decoding Logical Sequence Clocks & Calendars Series Input-Output Games & Tournaments
Scheduling Zebra Puzzle or Einstein’s Puzzle CAT 2021 Quantitative Aptitude Syllabus Number System Geometry & Mensuration Percentages Speed, Time and Distance Profit and Loss Simple & Compound Interest Time and Work Venn diagrams Averages Algebra – Linear & Quadratic Equations, Maxima-Minima,
Inequalities LCM and HCF Set Theory Binomial Theorem Complex Numbers Ratio and Proportion Logarithm Progressions Inequalities Permutation and Combination Probability Mixtures and Allegations Surds and Indices Related Articles CAT 2020 was held in three slots: the morning, afternoon and evening slots. Apart
from this, there were a host of changes including the reduced time limit (2 hours instead of 3 hours) and the paper pattern being unknown. One thing which remained the same was the sections: Verbal Ability and Reading Comprehension (VARC) Data Interpretation and Logical Reasoning (DILR) Quantitative Aptitude
(QA) The number of question in the CAT Question Paper 2020 was reduced to 76 questions with 26 questions each in VARC and QA while DILR accounted for 24 questions. The table given below shows the trends of the number of non-MCQs over the past few years. Year Number of non-MCQs CAT 2016 33 CAT 2017
26 CAT 2018 25 CAT 2019 26 CAT 2020 17 (Number of questions reduced from 100 to 76) The number of non-MCQs in CAT has been around 25-26 in recent times with a dip to 17 due to the reduced number of questions in CAT 2020. This can be a double-edged sword for the aspirants since the non-MCQs offered a
chance for aspirants to attempt the questions without any penalty but the lack of options also increased the difficulty of the question. Apart from this, the CAT Exam pattern for the past 3 CAT Previous Years Question Papers has remained the same. CAT 2019 did not throw any surprises in terms of the CAT exam
pattern. In terms of the level of difficulty, VARC was slightly trickier compared to last year, with 2 passages on the difficult side. Both DILR and Quant were slightly easier than last year. Overall, the paper was slightly less difficult, as compared to CAT 2018. An overall raw score of around 157-160 should fetch a 99%ile in
CAT 2019. CAT 2019 Slot 2 was similar to Slot 1 in terms of the level of difficulty. VARC was definitely tougher than CAT 2018 with a 99%ile at around 60-62 marks. DILR was 1-2 questions easier than last year with a 99%ile at 46-49 marks. The level of difficulty of QA was between that of CAT 2017 and CAT 2018.
99%ile in QA would be anywhere between 57 and 60 marks. Overall, the paper was similar of 1-2 questions easier than last year. A 99%ile will be at around 158-160. The CAT 2020 Paper was significantly different from the other CAT Previous Year Papers. The reduced time limit and questions meant that the cut off
reduced to a degree. In terms of the sectional difficulty level, the VARC section of CAT 2020 was similar in terms of difficulty to the VARC section in CAT 2019. The DILR section of CAT 2020 was quite tricky with the level of difficulty being similar to the DILR section of CAT 2016-18. The QA section was similar in terms
of difficulty level to the QA section of CAT 2019. The reduced questions and time limit meant that the cut off in terms of the value was reduced and a 99%ile could be obtained at a score of around 105. CAT 2020 CAT 2019 CAT 2018 CAT 2017 CAT 2016 %ile Score Score Score Score Score 99 104 160 154 174 156 95
100 125 121 138 123 90 90 108 103 118 105 80 80 85 79 93 82 As this table shows, the cutoff shifts by a huge amount depending on the level of difficulty of the paper. With the easy paper in 2017, 150 would have been only a mediocre score but with the same score in a more difficult paper of CAT 2016 or CAT 2018, it
would have been almost equal to a 99%ile. CAT 2019 was somewhere in between CAT 2017 and CAT 2018 with the 99%ile, 95%ile and 90%ile mark lying in between the values in the corresponding years. CAT 2020 is an aberration since the pattern changed during for this CAT Exam.
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